
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

  PRICE

 4 days PER 300.00 166.00  250.00  

Item 1 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 DAY 1,200.00 664.00 NO BID 1,000.00 NO BID

  PRICE

 2 weeks PER 1,050.00 500.00  750.00  

 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 Week 2,100.00 1,000.00 NO BID 1,500.00 NO BID

  PRICE

 1 month PER 2,700.00 1,500.00  2,200.00  

 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 MONTH 2,700.00 1,500.00 NO BID 2,200.00 NO BID

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo MCT85 Model 318 Skid Steer  Case TR270  

*

ITEM 1 TOTAL TOTAL 6,000.00 3,164.00 NO BID 4,700.00 NO BID

  PRICE

4 days PER 350.00 225.00  175.00 250.00

Item 2 Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT DAY 1,400.00 900.00 NO BID 700.00 1,000.00

PRICE

2 weeks PER 1,150.00 666.00  500.00 800.00

Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT Week 2,300.00 1,332.00 NO BID 1,000.00 1,600.00

PRICE

1 month PER 2,750.00 2,000.00  1,400.00 2,350.00

Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT MONTH 2,750.00 2,000.00 NO BID 1,400.00 2,350.00

John Deere  

Model 3230  

Manufacturer/Model Volvo MCT135 Track Loader  Case SR200  

*

ITEM 2 TOTAL TOTAL 6,450.00 4,232.00 NO BID 3,100.00 4,950.00

PRICE

 4 days PER 400.00 260.00  215.00  

Item 3 Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT DAY 1,600.00 1,040.00 NO BID 860.00 NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 1,200.00 780.00  625.00  

Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT Week 2,400.00 1,560.00 NO BID 1,250.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 2,850.00 2,340.00  1,850.00  

Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT MONTH 2,850.00 2,340.00 NO BID 1,850.00 NO BID
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY R
D
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John Deere   

Model 329E   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo M1CT35 Track Loader  Case SR220  

*

     

ITEM 3 TOTAL TOTAL 6,850.00 4,940.00 NO BID 3,960.00 NO BID

  PRICE

 4 days PER 210.00 200.00 235.00 200.00  

Item 4 D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB DAY 840.00 800.00 940.00 800.00 NO BID

 PRICE

 2 weeks PER 630.00 633.00 700.00 600.00  

 D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB Week 1,260.00 1,266.00 1,400.00 1,200.00 NO BID

 PRICE

1 week PER 1,800.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 1,700.00  

  D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB MONTH 1,800.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 1,700.00 NO BID

 

John Deere Ynmar  

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC35 35G Excavator VIO-35 Case CX17B  

*

 

ITEM 4 TOTAL TOTAL 3,900.00 3,966.00 4,440.00 3,700.00 NO BID

  PRICE

 4 days PER 175.00 166.00 180.00 200.00  

Item 5 Compact Excavator, Case CX17B DAY 700.00 664.00 720.00 800.00 NO BID

 PRICE

 2 weeks PER 525.00 500.00 535.00 600.00  

 Compact Excavator, Case CX17B Week 1,050.00 1,000.00 1,070.00 1,200.00 NO BID

 PRICE

1 week PER 1,575.00 1,500.00 1,600.00 1,700.00  

  Compact Excavator, Case CX17B MONTH 1,575.00 1,500.00 1,600.00 1,700.00 NO BID

 

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC20 Model 17 Excavator Yanmar U10-20   

*

 

ITEM 5 TOTAL TOTAL 3,325.00 3,164.00 3,390.00 3,700.00 NO BID

2



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY R
D
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PRICE

4 days PER 185.00 188.00 195.00 200.00  

Item 6 Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B DAY 740.00 752.00 780.00 800.00 NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 555.00 566.00 585.00 600.00  

Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B Week 1,110.00 1,132.00 1,170.00 1,200.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 1,665.00 1,700.00 1,750.00 1,700.00  

Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B MONTH 1,665.00 1,700.00 1,750.00 1,700.00 NO BID

 

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo MCR28 Model 27 Excavator Yanmar VIO-35   

*

 

ITEM 6 TOTAL TOTAL 3,515.00 3,584.00 3,700.00 3,700.00 NO BID

PRICE

4 days PER 210.00 200.00 235.00 250.00  

Item 7 Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B DAY 840.00 800.00 940.00 1,000.00 NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 630.00 633.00 700.00 700.00  

Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B Week 1,260.00 1,266.00 1,400.00 1,400.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 1,800.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 2,100.00  

Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B MONTH 1,800.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 2,100.00 NO BID

 

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC35 Model 35 Excavator Yanmar VIO-35   

*

 

ITEM 7 TOTAL TOTAL 3,900.00 3,966.00 4,440.00 4,500.00 NO BID

PRICE

4 days PER 210.00 200.00 235.00 250.00  

Item 8 Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B DAY 840.00 800.00 940.00 1,000.00 NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 630.00 633.00 700.00 700.00  

Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B Week 1,260.00 1,266.00 1,400.00 1,400.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 1,800.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 2,100.00  

Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B MONTH 1,800.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 2,100.00 NO BID
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY R
D
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John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC35 Model 35 Excavator Yanmar VIO-35   

*

 

ITEM 8 TOTAL TOTAL 3,900.00 3,966.00 4,440.00 4,500.00 NO BID

PRICE

4 days PER 300.00 266.00 310.00 300.00 250.00

Item 9 Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B DAY 1,200.00 1,064.00 1,240.00 1,200.00 1,000.00

PRICE

2 weeks PER 900.00 800.00 925.00 900.00 800.00

Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B Week 1,800.00 1,600.00 1,850.00 1,800.00 1,600.00

PRICE

1 month PER 2,400.00 2,400.00 2,750.00 2,100.00 2,400.00

Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B MONTH 2,400.00 2,400.00 2,750.00 2,100.00 2,400.00

John Deere  

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC55 Model 50 Excavator Yanmar VIO-55   

*

ITEM 9 TOTAL TOTAL 5,400.00 5,064.00 5,840.00 5,100.00 5,000.00

PRICE

 4 days PER 775.00 444.00  250.00  

Item 10 Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment and Bucket, Case 580 Super M Series DAY 3,100.00 1,776.00 NO BID 1,000.00 NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 2,175.00 1,333.00  850.00  

Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment and Bucket, Case 580 Super M Series Week 4,350.00 2,666.00 NO BID 1,700.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 5,200.00 4,000.00  1,700.00  

Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment and Bucket, Case 580 Super M Series MONTH 5,200.00 4,000.00 NO BID 1,700.00 NO BID

John Deere  Case  

Manufacturer/Model Volvo BL70 310 with Hoe Ram  580 Super N  

*

ITEM 10 TOTAL TOTAL 12,650.00 8,442.00 NO BID 4,400.00 NO BID

4



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY R
D
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PRICE

4 days PER 1,500.00 1,175.00  2,400.00  

Item 11 Excavator Tracked, Case CX470B DAY 6,000.00 4,700.00 NO BID 9,600.00 NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 4,500.00 3,525.00  6,000.00  

Excavator Tracked, Case CX470B Week 9,000.00 7,050.00 NO BID 12,000.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 13,500.00 10,575.00  13,000.00  

Excavator Tracked, Case CX470B MONTH 13,500.00 10,575.00 NO BID 13,000.00 NO BID

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC480D 470 Excavator    

*

ITEM 11 TOTAL TOTAL 28,500.00 22,325.00 NO BID 34,600.00 NO BID

PRICE

PER

Item 12 ITEM 12 DAILY RENTAL NOT AWARDED DAY

PRICE

2 weeks PER 3,070.00 2,425.00  2,600.00  

Motor Grader, Case 865VHP Tier III Week 6,140.00 4,850.00 NO BID 5,200.00 NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 9,200.00 7,275.00  6,500.00  

Motor Grader, Case 865VHP Tier III MONTH 9,200.00 7,275.00 NO BID 6,500.00 NO BID

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo 6930 770 Motor Grader    

 *

ITEM 12 TOTAL TOTAL 15,340.00 12,125.00 NO BID 11,700.00 NO BID

PRICE

4 days PER 210.00 266.00    

Item 13 D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Bobcate Kubota V-2203-EB DAY 840.00 1,064.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 630.00 800.00    

D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Bobcate Kubota V-2203-EB Week 1,260.00 1,600.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

5



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY R
D
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PRICE

1 month PER 1,800.00 2,400.00    

D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Bobcate Kubota V-2203-EB MONTH 1,800.00 2,400.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

John Deere   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC35 50 Excavator    

*  

 

ITEM 13 TOTAL TOTAL 3,900.00 5,064.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

PRICE

4 days PER 400.00 325.00    

Item 14 Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 DAY 1,600.00 1,300.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

PRICE

2 weeks PER 1,200.00 966.00    

Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 Week 2,400.00 1,932.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

PRICE

1 month PER 3,600.00 2,900.00    

Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 MONTH 3,600.00 2,900.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

John Deere  

Model 75/85   

Manufacturer/Model Volvo ECR88 Excavator    

*  

 

ITEM 14 TOTAL TOTAL 7,600.00 6,132.00 NO BID N/A NO BID

PRICE

4 days PER   1,000.00  600.00

Item 15 Rubber Tire Trencher, Astec RT960 DAY N/A NO BID 4,000.00 N/A 2,400.00

PRICE

2 weeks PER   3,000.00  2,400.00

Rubber Tire Trencher, Astec RT960 Week N/A NO BID 6,000.00 N/A 4,800.00

PRICE

1 month PER   9,000.00  7,000.00

Rubber Tire Trencher, Astec RT960 MONTH N/A NO BID 9,000.00 N/A 7,000.00

Manufacturer/Model   Vermeer RTT1250   

6



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1016

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 13, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY R
D
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*

ITEM 15 TOTAL TOTAL N/A NO BID 19,000.00 N/A 14,200.00

PRICE

4 days PER  185.00  250.00 250.00

Item 16 Loader Backhoe with Bucket Attachment DAY N/A 740.00 NO BID 1,000.00 1,000.00

PRICE

1 week PER  555.00  850.00 850.00

Loader Backhoe with Bucket Attachment Week N/A 1,110.00 NO BID 1,700.00 1,700.00

PRICE

1 month PER  1,665.00  1,700.00 1,700.00

Loader Backhoe with Bucket Attachment MONTH N/A 1,665.00 NO BID 1,700.00 1,700.00

    

John Deere  Case Case

Manufacturer/Model  310 Backhoe  580 N Series 580 N Series

*

ITEM 16 TOTAL TOTAL N/A 3,515.00 NO BID 4,400.00 4,400.00

PRICE

4 days PER   3,666.00  5,000.00

Item 17 Rock Trencher Tracked DAY N/A NO BID 14,664.00 N/A 20,000.00

PRICE    

2 weeks PER   11,000.00  10,000.00

Rock Trencher Tracked Week N/A NO BID 22,000.00 N/A 20,000.00

PRICE    

1 month PER   33,000.00  28,000.00

Rock Trencher Tracked MONTH N/A NO BID 33,000.00 N/A 28,000.00

   

Manufacturer/Model   Vermeer T755  Vermeer T755

*

ITEM 17 TOTAL TOTAL N/A NO BID 69,664.00 N/A 68,000.00

  

 TOTAL FOR ITEMS AWARDED 15,215.00 43,364.00 26,860.00 82,200.00

 

 EXTENSION 1 15,215.00 43,364.00 26,860.00 82,200.00

 

 EXTENSION 2 15,215.00 43,364.00 26,860.00 82,200.007
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler LoaderS

TIME & (September 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014)
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 EXTENSION 3 15,215.00 43,364.00 26,860.00 82,200.00
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 Terms

 

 

Delivery Days 2-24 hours 2-3 hours 48 hours 75 hours

*LOW BIDDER  

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

ASCO RSC Equipment Rental SAWS Website

 Aztec Rental Sunbelt Rental

Equipment Depot Tool Belt 

 Hertz Equipment Rental United Rentals

Neff Rental Vermeer

RDO Equipment Co. Volvo Rents

Rocky Hill Equipment

9


